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Footage of Epsom College murders aftermath not for
idle police viewing
An ex-serving Surrey Police officer has been banned from the profession for gross misconduct after viewing body-worn camera
footage of a “significant local and national case” without a legitimate reason.

The Local Democracy Reporting Service understands that the footage was of the moment the headteacher of Epsom College was
found dead. Surrey Police have not confirmed which specific footage was viewed, however the date of the footage aligns with the
date that officers were called to Epsom College.

Emma Pattison, 45, was found dead alongside her seven-year-old Lettie, in the grounds of the Surrey school, on 5 February 2023.
Mrs Pattison’s husband, George Pattison, is believed to have shot them at their home before killing himself.

The former Surrey Police cop, Mr Baseer Ahmed, admitted he watched the body-worn video (BWV) footage of the serious incident
on 5 February, but denies he did so without a policing purpose.

The police misconduct hearing panel, held July 1, found Mr Ahmed breached professional standards as he unnecessarily watched
footage of the police attending the scene, where the victims were found.

Professional standards state that there must be an express policing purpose to access body-worn camera footage, to ensure it is
not accessed unnecessarily.

Mr Ahmed watched some- not all- of the footage on February 7, days after the major incident was reported, and picked up by
newspapers. He was not given specific instructions to look at the footage nor carry out any enquiries, according to the misconduct
report.

A Staff Officer for Chief Superintendent Budd since 2022, Mr Ahmed’s role included accessing additional information for his Chief
Superintendent. Working in West Surrey, the panel noted it was not in this instance appropriate for Mr Ahmed to find out
information from other divisions.

The panel found Mr Ahmed did not appear to be watching the video as part of a genuine work activity. For example, he made no
notes, did not attempt to discover the location of the incident or tell any senior colleagues about it.

Although admitting he watched part of the video footage, Mr Ahmed has continually denied not having a justifiable policing
purpose for accessing the footage. He also denies a breach of the standards and that his conduct amounts to gross misconduct.

The panel was not satisfied and Mr Ahmed was found to have breached standards of professional behaviour, confidentiality,
orders and instructions. The report reads: “It is important to remember the high standards that members of the public rightly
expect Police Officers to adhere to, the extremely difficult circumstances being faced by family members in this particular case
and the likely effect that unnecessary viewing of the footage would have on them.”

The panel agreed this amounted to gross misconduct and it would harm the public’s view of the police service for watching
footage of a major incident without legitimate purpose. This was aggravated by Mr Ahmed acting contrary to national guidance,
without any specific instructions and continuing asserting he had valid policing reasons to access the footage.

Mr Ahmed resigned from Surrey Police on December 15, 2023 – 10 months from the incident- with his last day being January 15
this year. If he was still a serving officer, the panel said he would have been dismissed to maintain public confidence in and to
uphold high standards in policing

Whilst Mr Ahmed attended the two Pre-hearings, he did not attend the misconduct hearing due to ‘personal reasons’ he cited in
an email.

Head of Professional Standards, Superintendent Andy Rundle said: “The public rightly expect that police officers behave at all
times with integrity and respect.

“Ex-officer Ahmed breached this trust when he looked at body worn footage of a crime scene, despite having no policing purpose.
This behaviour is not acceptable, and a thorough professional standards investigation was launched.”

A full inquest into the deaths of George, Emma and Lettie Pattison is due to take place later this month on July 30.
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Surrey police said they are not officially confirming what body worn footage Mr Ahmed viewed due to “other ongoing judicial
processes” that have not yet been concluded. The full inquests into the deaths are expected to take place on July 30.  Surrey
Police confirmed it is the Epsom College incident “off the record”.
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