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Salts give Mullets taste for big victory
Arundel FC 5-1 Epsom & Ewell FC. Saturday 25th March.

Arundel, nicknamed the Mullets, secured their first ever competitive victory over us in comprehensive circumstances at Mill Road
on Saturday afternoon with a 5-1 drubbing, and make no mistake, we could have no real complaints here.
Top of Southern Combination League Division One

We made some changes once again from our narrow but comfortable win over Montpelier Villa two weeks previously. Jaan
Stanley and Athan Smith-Joseph were not available and originally Jaevon Dyer was listed as a substitute, due to a breakdown on
route to the picturesque ground. Fortunately he arrived in time and was then added to the team sheet at the expense of Steve
Springett who dropped to the bench. Alex Penfold also joined him there, while Lewis Pearch came in for his first start and we had
another new centre back pairing of Dylan Merchant and Oliver Thompson with Kevin Moreno-Gomez also returning to the starting
eleven alongside them.

On a blustery day we made an awful start and went behind in the eleventh minute as a harmless enough attack on the left
suddenly turned dangerous with a ball across goal that was turned into the net by Carl Brown. Six minutes later Tom Theobald
made a decent punch clear of a looping header and appeared to be fouled in the process, yet a corner was awarded and in the
18th minute the inswinging delivery caught Theobald out in the swirling wind and he dropped the ball over the line for Arundel’s
second goal.

We had created little to this point although Jamie Byatt fashioned a half chance a couple of minutes after the goal, only to see his
shot blocked by a defender. Dyer then made decent progress down the right flank but his pull back was behind both Byatt and
Pearch.

Regrettably we then went three nil down in the 33rd minute as a clever pass floated over the top of Moreno-Gomez where Brown
was waiting to drill the ball into the net from an angle and it nearly got worse six minutes later when James Crane then hit the bar
as we were carved open again. The half ended with the home side having another good chance from a corner but the unmarked
Harry Russell headed over the bar.

This was a horrible first half to watch and whilst you always feel that a good start to the second half could spark some sort of
comeback, it really looked as though the only win we were likely to celebrate at Arundel was when long-serving supporter John
Bonner won a crate of lager in the club raffle!

The other item of note at the half time break was the sight of our entire Management team standing outside the dressing room as
the players clearly had some sort of discussion without them. Whatever was said, it seemed to work for a while. We made two
substitutions with Rory Edwards and Springett coming on for the limping Smith and Moreno-Gomez respectively and nearly
scored straight away as a Springett corner was flicked just over the bar by Nick Wilson. Next up with a decent chance was Gavin
Quintyne who tried his luck with his weaker foot and sliced the opportunity wide. However, he made amends in the 50th minute
when he weaved his way across the edge of the penalty area before threading a pass through to Byatt, who guided the ball back
across Oliver Howley in the Arundel goal from twelve yards which then crept in off the far post to get us back in the game.

Another Springett corner caused trouble as Merchant headed the delivery towards Thompson, whose header was just over the
bar, but our only period of superiority in the match was about to end. Thompson limped off with an injured knee and whilst it was
good to see Johnny “Sonic” Akoto returning after a few weeks out, his introduction required a defensive reshuffle. Whether this
had a bearing on the next Arundel goal in the 63rd minute is hard to say, but a harmless ball in from the right was struck at goal
by an unmarked player, and whilst Theobald made a good save from the first shot, Will Breden was also in acres of space and he
drove the loose ball home from a few yards out with our defence absolutely nowhere in sight.

In the 72nd minute it got worse still as a low ball in from the right was tapped in at the far post for a fifth goal by Breden once
again, and we were lucky not to concede more with Wilson being our latest sin-bin visitor around this time, while Byatt and
Quintyne both picked up yellow cards for fouls to go with the first half issue to Smith. Our afternoon was then summed up when
Dyer put substitute George Owusu through on goal ten minutes from time, only for him to tread on the ball in the act of shooting!

Now that ten man Shoreham’s victory over East Preston has virtually guaranteed them the title, it is imperative we cling on to
second place to guarantee the home playoff matches. The players kept trying in this contest, even at the end and I’m aware that
some more new signings are likely as we approach the transfer deadline on 31st March, but if we don’t get back to winning ways
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on Wednesday at Mile Oak, we could slip out of that position. We cannot make any more mistakes now.

This is not just about us though. We didn’t play well but full credit should also go to Arundel who played with a lot of energy and
just appeared to cover a lot more ground per player than we did and will no doubt chase Selsey all the way for that final playoff
spot, in which case we may well see them again before the end of the season. However, this is a massive reality check for us. Are
we actually good enough to go up? We’ll probably find out the answer to that question on Wednesday as we face a Mile Oak team
that have also lost 5-1 this weekend.

Epsom & Ewell: Tom Theobald, Gideon Acheampong, Kevin Moreno-Gomez, Ryan Smith (c), Oliver Thompson, Dylan Merchant,
Jaevon Dyer, Nick Wilson, Jamie Byatt, Gavin Quintyne, Lewis Pearch

Subs: Steve Springett for Moreno-Gomez, (HT), Rory Edwards for Smith (HT), Johnny Akoto for Thompson (58), George Owusu for
Byatt (76)
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